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On October 10, 2024, Shri Shivaji Science College, Congress Nagar, Nagpur, witnessed a
momentous occasion with the inauguration of subject societies for all nine science
departments. This event marked a significant milestone in the college's academic landscape,
fostering a platform for students to explore their interests, engage in research, and develop
essential skills.

Dr. O.S. Deshmukh, the esteemed principal of the college, graced the occasion as the chief
patron of all the societies while Dr. Vijay Thakre, Deputy Director of Forensic Science,
Nagpur was the Chief Guest. Ms. Aishwarya Mendawade, a distinguished student member of
the Physics Department, is appointed as the President of the Physics Society for the session
2024-25. The list of office bearers of Physics Society is as following.

Miss. Aishwarya Mendawade - President (B.Sc. 3rd Yr)

Miss. Sraddha Raut- Vice President (MSc. IInd yr)

Miss. Anushka Palandurkar – Secretary (B. Sc. IIIrd yr)

Mr. Yugansh Kanoje -Jt. Secretary - (B. Sc. 2nd yr),Mr. Jatin Karde-Treasurer and following
students are the Executive members of Physics Society:

Mr. Huzefa Arviwala (B.Sc. 3rd yr),

Miss. Ayesha Jabeen – (B.Sc. 2nd yr),

Miss. Priya Singh- (B.Sc. 2nd yr),

Ms. Sejal Tandekar- (B. Sc. 1st year),

Mr. Mohit Dhandale- (B. Sc. 1st year),

Miss Hansika Jamgade- (B. Sc. 1st year),

Ekta Khursankar- (B. Sc. 1st year),

Aarohi Tembhurne- (B. Sc. 1st year)

The inauguration ceremony was held in the conference hall of the college. The event
commenced with a traditional lamp lighting ceremony, symbolizing the illumination of
knowledge and the pursuit of academic excellence. Distinguished faculty members, students,
and staff members gathered to witness this historic event.



The inauguration of each subject society was marked with enthusiasm and anticipation. The
departments of Botany, Chemistry, Computer Science, English, Geology, Mathematics,
Microbiology, Physics, and Zoology were all represented with their respective societies.

Dr. Rupali Bhagat Patil, Convener of Science Association, given the introductory remark. The
Dr. Vijay Thakre, Deputy Director of Forensic Science, Nagpur was the guest speaker for this
program. Dr. Thakre guided the students about the important investigations in many cases in
forensic science laboratory. He has also discussed about the various opportunities in forensic
science.

Dr. Deshmukh, in his presidential address, emphasized the importance of subject societies in
providing students with opportunities for intellectual growth and personal development. He
encouraged students to actively participate in society activities and make the most of the
resources available to them. All the faculty members were present on this occession.








